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- Re: Fwd: Re: NKKW Claimant funding payment schedule application

[ 77 3 21 - T — — ]

From: NYREE COZZI- ‘
To: ) ) Steve McKenzie

Date: 9/02/2012 11:52 a.m.
Subject: Re: Fwd: Re: NKKW Claimant funding payment schedule application

ioming Withheld under saction
8{2)(a) of the Offici

Thank you for the response and [ will v k., )f Hion At - ;al

email a copy of the statement to you armation Act 1982 @

Nyree

. @?X Q@ B>

Sent: Thursday, 9 February 2012 7:09 AM
Subject: Re: Fwd: Re: NKKW Claimant fundlng p appll

in a couple of hours.. @ «
C

Morena

Yes I have it now and will be@‘ you day

Are you able to get 1330 P send thro the NKKW bank deposit slip, so Finance can
confirm the umber‘7

In th@ will bi:i@; plication process and provide you with an update early next
week

| o\
Enjoy th Q) Ohda.‘/ Withheld under saction

@ Y{2)(a) of the Official
information Act 1982,

>>>NYREE COZZI 8/02/2012 6:20 p.m. >>>
Hi

Did you not recieve my OTS funding application which I emailed to
Adam with OUR EQY financial details on it.

The template which you emailed is the same as the one I emailed to

Adam.

Please inform ASAP

From e ) : N — / -
To: NYREE COZZI Steve McKenzie V\ thheld under mﬁil@ﬁ
Sent: Wednesday, 8 February 2012 11:14 AM b 2)\(;“:1) of the Official

Subject: Re: Fwd: Re: NKKW Claimant funding payment schedule application Informa Hion Act 1082.
St i
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Kia ora Nyree
Thanks for your email.

I have attached the OTS funding template and guidelines - apologies that this has not reached you
until now.

Once we receive your funding application, it will take approx 10 days to process.

Please also send me a copy of the bank deposit slip for the account NKKW account you would like
the funds to be deposited into.

Hope the sun is shining in Adelaide. Let me know if you have any questions and I eavoul tO
help. e b ol

Withikeld under saction \
Nga mihi 9(2)(a) of the Official Qﬁ

Information Act 1982

] I Analyst I Office of Tleatyﬁ <t> /) <<>>®
.z /\\
['e Tari Whakatau Take e pa ana ﬁ=t )\Valtancrl K%
>>> NYREE COZZI @

32 p.m. >>>
Good morning
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Or emaj Qconc %ﬁm ing process and template
we are using late that we recieved from OTS
VQ d from me.
ess ave changed please contact me via email or

‘\/“\’iihl‘z@id under saction
o(2)(a) of the Officia !
Em@ nation Act 1982.

From:

Cc: o > Steve McKenzie <sgmckenzie@xtra..co.nz>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 February 2012 10:28 AM
Subject: Re: Fwd: Re: NKKW Claimant funding payment schedule application

Kia ora Nyree
I work with and he forwarded me your email regarding claimant funding for

NKKW. Would it be possible for us to have a quick chat sometime today? I would like to run
through the OTS claimant funding process with you and also go through the funding template that
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OTS requires be filled out when funding applications are made.

My phone number is , or if you prefer, I can call you - just send me your number and we
can get the claimant funding process underway today.

I look forward to speaking with you soon. v
| Withhesid under saction
Niga ki 9(2)(a) of the Official
Information Act 1982.

>>>NYREE COZZI1 3/02/2012 8:00 p.m. >>>

Hi ‘

I was unable to open the attachment please re-email @

the attachment using another program. And we just >
need to know if we are successful with our funding o (9

and when will the amount be deposited into our O
account. . @ =
Regards @ @
Nyree XB K}

From: _ @

To: NYREE COZzZI \ @

Sent: Friday, 3 Februa N ‘ @

Subject: Fwd: Re: N ehedule application

aimant fundi g@&
%@3 or ther mim%&\ogies because I did say we'd get back to you earlier in
ents below.
>

Q% Withheld under ssction
9(2)(a) of the Officia

- Information Act 1982,

Cc: Steve McKenzie

ry-20

I Office of Treaty Settlements
I www.ots.govt.nz

e Tari Whakatau Take e pa ana ki te Tiriti o Waitangi
3/02/2012 9:24 a.m. >>>

Thanks for sending through the NKKW Trust Board 2010/2011 expenses. I've reviewed the
expenses and they accord with the OTS cost categories set out in the OTS Claimant Funding Policy
and Guidelines.

Please let me know whether I can provide further assistance.

Na Withheld under section
9(2)(a) of the Official
Information Act 1982
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Withheld under gssction
> 19/01/2012 5:46 p.m. >>> ¥(2)(a) of the Ofiicial
Kia ora Nyree Information Act 1962.
Thanks for providing us with the NKKW Trust Board 2010/2011 expenses.

I've asked to look at this, she is the claimant funding guru for our team. She'll have a
look at it next week if that's OK and we'll get back to you later in the week.

I hope everything is going well for you.

nga mihi Not relevant
to request /

>>>NYREE COZZI : 18/01/2012 4:15p
Kia ora
Nga mihi mahana kia koutou katoa i)
E,,:d under section
Attached is a copy of the above July2010 - Jun@

for approval. <°' 1) of the Official
Happy New Year and I hope y @eges

[ nformation Act 1982
had an enjoyable christm s»

@3
< O
Please inform @ h outcmﬁ%

Aroha Pa“

=

1( ail message and attachments do not necessarily reflect the views of
the New Zealand Ministry of Justice and may contain

information that is confidential and may be subject to legal privilege. If you
are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that you must not use,
disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail message or its attachments. If you
received this message in error, please notify the Ministry of Justice

by telephone (call collect: 00-64-4-918-8800) or return the

original message to us by e-mail, and destroy any copies.

Thank you.

This e-mail message and attachments do not necessarily reflect the views of
the New Zealand Ministry of Justice and may contain

information that is confidential and may be subject to legal privilege. If you
are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that you must not use,
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disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail message or its attachments. If you
received this message in error, please notify the Ministry of Justice

by telephone (call collect: 00-64-4-918-8800) or return the

original message to us by e-mail, and destroy any copies.

Thank you.

This e-mail message and attachments do not necessarily reflect the views of
the New Zealand Ministry of Justice and may contain

information that is confidential and may be subject to legal privilege. If you
are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that you must not use, g\

disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail message or its attachments. If yQM/ \
received this message in error, please notify the Ministry of Justice o

by telephone (call collect: 00- 64 4-918-8800) or return the C ) b\
original message to us by e-mail, and destroy any copies. % &
Thank you. @ &
<\<\\\
O @
%\( \ NN

\X\>v
This e-mail message s do n t@ @ eflect the views of
d%}i

the New Zealand stlce

1nf01mat1on tlal and ct to legal privilege. If you
are not th 01p1ent u ale ‘eby notified that you must not use,
disse uﬁi 1bute T %\1 -mail message or its attachments. If you
receiv t}hs mess lease notify the Ministry of Justice

by telep one 11 -64 4-918-8800) or return the

ongmal ﬁy e-mail, and destroy any copies.

Thanl

((\\

Withheld under saction
9(2)(a) of the Official
information Act 1982.
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